


"MUZATFARABAD'

Dated: 1-12- 1594,
NOTIFICATICN.
mo.bU/K/iKbQ\A»q- /9% . In exercisec of the Powers conferred

by sub-sccticn 23 of Civil Scrvant Act 1976, the President
Azad Jammu & Kashmir is pleased %o direct that the fcllowing
further amendments shall be made in the Rovised Lesave Rules
198% namely:-

In +he aforesaid Rules, after sub-rule (2) -of:

rule 32 the fellowing new sub-rule shall be added, namely:-

{2 s s = e e IR -
"(AY A civil gervant shall be entitled to the
leave pay 23t the revised rate of pay 1f 3 genersl

revision i pry ~f oivil servant takes place or

21 gnnuzal dvizing the period of

//%/Z\/\,,//zé;éj:il;,,»fﬁ

~{SARDAR ALI PUHAMMAD KHAN)
Deputy Secretsry Finsnce
: (Regulations)

/17—

No.% Date cven: Jee T,

CApy-tn:e

.

4~ Secrctary ta the President Azad Janmu & Koshwmir.

2— Secretary tr~ the Prime Minister Azsd Govt. of the
Stat {

e of Jawmmu & Kashmir.
% Privaste 3ecretary t~ the 3peaker Legistative As8embly.

4— Private BSecrc’ siy to the Ministers

5- Private retary t- the Mohtasib.

6~ Private Secretary to the Chini Scoretary.
7- Additional Cuief 3¢
8- All Secretaries tr the Covernaent.

O~ All Hesds of Attzll
State of Jammu and I

&

d Departments, Azad Govt. of the
Keshmir,Muzaffarabad.

10~ Jenior Member Brard of Revenue,
11« Additionzsl Chief Secretaries.

12— Chairm=n F.M. Inspectisn Team/4 .JASC/AKMIDC/MDA Hirpur/
DAM H'nbau/aﬂcrotsry Roard of Bducation Mirpur.

13- Registrar Supreme Court/High Court/Shariat Crurt/Service
Tribunal.




Ne. TD/R/1--(683)/82(F
AZAD GOVERNMENT OF THE ST
B

FIWA

1)
£ OF JAMPU D KASHWIE
DEP ARTMENT, .

TMUZATT ARABAD!
DATED 29,.4.1986.

inqnce?
af the State of J&K,

Frorm: Mr, Kuurshee
%ecretaxv ™
Nz ad: Govh,
Mz af farabad.

To, : '

4. ”ddﬂ omal Chief Secrabary (Dev),
2. A1l Secretaries to Governmenb,
%, A11 Heads of-\ttaghpd Department' s,
vzad Govt, of the State of J&K,
Muzaffarabad,
gubject: ENCASHMENT OF LEAVE PREFARATORY TO
RETTIREMENT,
Birs
- T am Jdirected o vefer fo lehter Wo.
/ Z’I} o PD/B74R-8808/ daked 29.8. 1983 and subsequent
y ) ete. ] !
C _ . )
; medificatioms of the instructions contained in
thils department letter Nos. D/ 7070-7169/85 gated \ £ /7
e /o
20,5, 1985 =and ”D'V4”O ”QCO/Rr dated 20, G 1985 and {
to shtate that the competent quthority myy, where
it 1a satinfied that the leave applied for by 2
civil servant (Auring period of leave gurrendered
‘fop encashrisnt) is unaveidable or is fully Jjustified,
e.z. in cases of illness, supporbed hy medical cer A
ficate or for performance of Waj, otc., grant leave -
T ' 0 an emmlnoves Auring this pericd. In such a €Ase, b
S ' however, the ancuny nf cagh compernsction shall be
¥ : - '
redquced bv an amount equnl o the leave pay for nalf
of the period of leave kaken. 7o sxemple if an
emplorae who has opted for encashment of PR, takes
60 ‘days of such Ieave , his castt compensetion equal o
%0. davg leave nAY will be fora-feited,
- “\
: e et g0 I )




AZAD GOVERHMLN

I i\‘; U‘ZILJJ l" Al i i[ ;) !
4 /,ﬁ.,,g wAGHE ¥
HNOTIFICATION
NO.FD/R/WSQEE«”%Z /88, In exercise of

the powers conferred by 5@ction % of the Azad

e

Jammu & Kashmir Civil Serveuug Act, 1976 the

Fresident, Azsd Jsmuu & Kesh

direct that the fol: nendment shall bhe
made in the Revised Iesve Rules, 1937, newely:-

15, 1In scrvice death(ﬂ) In caze o civil

d o
incspacisted for further service while
&

G
in service ty a Medioal BoaLd, é lumpsum
payment cgusl to leagve psy uphto one
hundred snd eighty dsys out of the
leave %o bilg credit sholl be made to
his family ss defined for the purgoses
ol fsmily pension or, as the csse may be,

S10
g to the civil servant.

(2) Tor the purpose of lumpsum psyhent

under sub rule (1), only the " 8enior rost _
Allowsuce' will be included in the "leaver

Pay" so sdmissible,

2 These orders shall take effect from 16th

September, 1985

Your obedient servant,

4 - /ﬁ
&/\4//(‘\.{;/{/: 2 .»-'f/ ]

Y-

[ Mip fbdul Hagid )
Deputy Secretary Pinsnce,
(Regulationsg),




AZAD GOVIRNMENT OF

To

gpbdect -

dated 2841 986 on the st

during the last year by-2 retirin

who opts for encashm

mentioned

lesve will

for which.

L

FINANCE DEPARTHENT

HUZATTARABAD'

pazEn I M=t -

1. The Additional Chief Secretaries,

2. 211 Secretaries to the Government,
5. N1 Heads of the Attached Department,
- AzadGovt: of ‘the State of J&K

ENP‘SHMUNT or LEAVE PREPARATORY TO
STIREME

,...,J,‘g»-r

I am direcicd U6 reler to para 1 of this

circular letter Mo .FD/R/1-(E8)/82(P=TIII) T

aoted subject and to 3ay

Jammu znd Kashmir has been

vhere leave Of any
v leave without pzy is taken &

in the -above oo

snce , the peried of such

be reduced. from 180 days or Aassnr period

P

. .
the encashuosiic is 3110kﬂa.

Your cobedient servant,

oy A 1.
YA
(kh i Tot5mmad Sadig Dar )
Deputy Secretary Hinance

-

i
{(Regulations)




vy

Azad Govt. of the State of Jammu & Kashmir
(Finance Department)

“Muzaffarabad”
31" October, 2013
Notification: | " | | o

No. FDIR/ /7898 -1749 o 12013, In exercise of the powers conferred by Section 23 of the Civil
Servants Act, 1976, the President Azad Jammu and Kashmir hag been pleased to adopt Nofification No

FD-SR-l1/2- 141/2012 dated 09-09-2013 of Finance Department, Government of the Punjab wuth the
following amendments In Rule 17 of the Revised Leave Rules, 1983,

AMENDMENTS

() InRule 17, for the words “One hundred and elghty” wherever occurring, the words
“three hundred and sixty flve” shall be substituted; and.

(i) In sub-rules.(2) & (5) for the words “One hundrad and elghty” the words. “ three
hundred and sixty five” shall be substituted.

(i) After sub- rule (), amencled as aforesald, the following new sub- rules :shall be
inserted, namely:-

(6)  Encashment of leave preparatory to retirement (LPR) not exceeding three
hundred and sixty five days shall be effective from the first'day: of
September, 2013 and shall, for the entire period of leave refused or opted
for encashment, be applicable o a civil servant retired or, as the cases
may be, reliring on or after the firat day of September,2013, provided such - -

leave Is avallable at his credit subject to a maximum of three hundred and -
sixty five days.

(6-A)  The encashment of LPR shall also be applicable to employeefs of the
autonomous and semi- autonomous bodies under Admlnlstratlve control

of the AJ&K Govt. which have adopted basic pay scales schemes and
these rules in toto.

(6-B)  If at any time during such period, leave is granted on account of ill health
supported by Medical Certificate or for performance of Hajj, the amount of
cash compensation on account of leave pay shall be*reduced by an
amount equal to the leave pay for the period of leave so granted. * -

(6-C)  Leave pay for the purpose of encashment of LPR shall be computed on

the basis of pay and allowances reckonable towards pension as shown in
the last pay certificate of a civil servant, -

\9\«-\1& E

(Inaya i
Deputy Secretary (Regs.)




Azad Govt. of the State of Jammu & Kashmir

(Finance Department)

“Muzaffarabad”
10" November, 2014

No. FD/R/ »12r1, 212 =% [2014, In exercise of the powers conferred by Section 23 of
the AJ&K Clvil Servants Act, 1976 and in continuation of Finance Department's notification
No. FD/R/17898-17970/2013 dated 31-10-2013, the President Azad Jammu and Kashmir
has been pleased to Insert following amendment In Rule 19 of the Revised Leave
Rules, 1983 w.e.f. 01-09-2013:-

St s B v e
R bt 7 e

“In Rule 19, for the words “one hundred and eighty” wherever occurring,

the words “three hundred and sixty five" shall be substituted.” _
"\

i\\

f /\
(Inayat Ah Qazn)
E Deputy Secretary (Regs.)
. Copy to the:~
E 1. Secretary to the President, Azad Jammu & Kashmlr,
2, Secretary to the Prime Minister, Azad Govt. of the State of Jammu & Kashmir,

1 Private Secretarles to all the Ministers/Advisors/Special Asslstant to the Prime Minister, Azad Gowt.
of the State of Jammu & Kashmir,

4. Private Secretary to the Chairman Prime Minister Ingpection & Implementation Commission, Azad
Govt. of the State of Jammu & Kashmir.

Private Secretary to the Chigf Secretary, Azad Gout, of the State of Jammu & Kashmir.

Private Secretary to the Additional Chief Secretary (Gen.), Azad Govt, of the State of Jammu &
Kashmir,

Private Secretary to the Senior Member Board of Revenue, Azad Gowt. of the State of Jammu &
Kashmir,

8, Private Secretary to the Additional Chief Secretary (Dev.), Azad Govt. of the State of Jammu &
Kashmir.

9. Private Secretary to the Secretary Finance, Azad Govt, of the State of Jammu & Kaghmir,
10. All Secretarles, Azad Govt. of the State of Jammu & Kashmir.
11, Reglstrar Supreme Court/High Court/Shariat Court/Service Tribunal.

12, Registrar AJ&K University Muzaffarabad / Mirpur University of Sclence & Technology (MUST)/
Poonch University Rawalakot/ Women University Bagh/ Unliversity of Management Sciences &
Information Technology Kotli .

13, Accountant General, Azad Jammu & Kashmir.
14, Director General Audit, Azad Jammu & Kashmir.
15, Director Local Funds Audit,

16. All Heads of Attached Departments.

17. Controller Govt. Printing Press.

18. Master Fle. | (X)\JW(\ .
(Khawaja Khurs d Ahmed)
Section Officer (Regs.)

@ v

~




f e e eaenpie .

T, - o R - .

. A
2. " A eivil-servant who wishes to. forego

‘hig LPR; in favour of c=sh compensation shail

’éxercise his ortion to this effect in writine and

suhmlt it to the quthhrltv romnntnnt to sancktion

LBR, who will: qoonot Lna omtlon and issue formal

sanction for the qumant of cash compansation,

3er L - Unloss a civil - sarvant opts to
~

fprocced on 1nqvoprepnmﬁwry o retirement =nd

submits an '-:»ﬁnlicqtion for.LPR, he may be deemad

to have ootod for encashment of LPR, according

I —_— -

___‘\____________/’______
to the rules, and on receipt.of a request from
a civil servant desmed to ha2ve opted for encash-

ment of TPR, the ~ahhor1tv ﬂomp@tont to snanction
LPR, will issve formsi "qncblﬂn Tor bbn pavment

P
-

of cash compensation,

,

4, - 111 mending or-praviously.decided
cages where a. civil servant has failed to exercise

aption for encashment, for LPR,.mav be. decid~d

~in.the licht of thes~ ingtrustions.

Your.obedirnt servant,
2T s
(th’ﬁgﬁ;mmﬂd Latif)
J01nt Secretary Finance,
~ (Regulations),s

e

Copy of tha above is forwarded 50:—

. The Secratary to the Prasident,
NIRE , Muzaffarabad,

2, The Principal Secretary to ths=
Prime Minister, #zad Govt, of the
State ot J&K, Muzaifarabad,

3. Private Sacrebaries to the Ministevs.

4, , Privete Secretary to the Chiefl Secre®izry,
élq h K11 Officsrs of the Finance Devartment,
6. A1l Qfficers of the Services =nd

ftenaral Administration Dep=rtment,

Ccntd..P/?



